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ABSTRACT                                                                                                                                       ARTICLE DATA 

Traditional paper art in China is extensive and profound, and as an intangible cultural 
heritage, the paper sculpture art of Ganzhou Hakka is also faced with the difficulty of 
dissemination and inheritance. The purpose of this design research is to disseminate and 
inherit the artistic characteristics of Hakka paper sculptures and the inherent cultural 
origins of paper sculptures. Therefore, with book design as the carrier, the innovation of 
books should not only respect all kinds of traditional Chinese book design culture, but also 
integrate innovative methods into the design of art forms. In the dissemination of Hakka 
paper sculpture skills and culture, it is just combined with the design of the concept book, in 
order to achieve the effect of simultaneously disseminating and inheriting the art, skills and 
culture of Hakka paper sculpture in the book, allowing readers to touch the artistic charm of 
paper sculpture in areas other than the museum, and have a deeper understanding of the 
inheritance and innovation culture of traditional paper art. 
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1. INTRODUCTION 

In 2020, Ganzhou Hakka paper sculpture was officially 
identified by the Ganzhou Municipal People's 
Government as the fifth batch of representative 
projects of municipal intangible cultural heritage in 
Ganzhou. Hakka paper sculpture can also be called 
"carved paper", which is inherited from the 
development of gold and silver leveling skills in the 
Han Dynasty. After the generation, in the northern 
region of China, the folks have always been popular in 
cutting "colorful paper". Until the Tang Dynasty, the 
gold and silver leveling skills were still favored by the 
folks, making their skills handed down from 
generation to generation. Until the Song Dynasty, the 
development and maturity of the paper industry also 
made the traditional paper art develop to a certain 
extent. Paper sculpture in the Ming and Qing 
Dynasties also gradually developed and matured, and 
reached its peak in its skills and arts. Ganzhou Hakka 
paper sculpture is a continuation of ancient paper 

carving techniques and innovative exhibitions. This 
design research takes the concept book design as the 
carrier, aiming to combine the artistic characteristics 
of Hakka paper sculpture with the communication 
effect of the concept book, and create a paper 
sculpture concept book design work with light, 
shadow and three-dimensional effect. It promotes 
Hakka paper sculpture from an innovative 
perspective, allowing readers to have a deeper and 
more convenient understanding of Ganzhou's 
intangible culture — Hakka paper sculpture art [1]. 

2. GANZHOU HAKKA PAPER 
SCULPTURE ART FEATURES 

2.1. Hollow Art 

Gannan Hakka paper sculpture is an innovative and 
developed art of carving and hollowing out based on 
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1. INTRODUCTION 
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identified by the Ganzhou Municipal People's 
Government as the fifth batch of representative 
projects of municipal intangible cultural heritage in 
Ganzhou. Hakka paper sculpture can also be called 
"carved paper", which is inherited from the 
development of gold and silver leveling skills in the 
Han Dynasty. After the generation, in the northern 
region of China, the folks have always been popular in 
cutting "colorful paper". Until the Tang Dynasty, the 
gold and silver leveling skills were still favored by the 
folks, making their skills handed down from 
generation to generation. Until the Song Dynasty, the 
development and maturity of the paper industry also 
made the traditional paper art develop to a certain 
extent. Paper sculpture in the Ming and Qing 
Dynasties also gradually developed and matured, and 
reached its peak in its skills and arts. Ganzhou Hakka 
paper sculpture is a continuation of ancient paper 

carving techniques and innovative exhibitions. This 
design research takes the concept book design as the 
carrier, aiming to combine the artistic characteristics 
of Hakka paper sculpture with the communication 
effect of the concept book, and create a paper 
sculpture concept book design work with light, 
shadow and three-dimensional effect. It promotes 
Hakka paper sculpture from an innovative 
perspective, allowing readers to have a deeper and 
more convenient understanding of Ganzhou's 
intangible culture — Hakka paper sculpture art [1]. 
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the characteristics of traditional paper-cutting 
techniques. The hollow carving of each piece is 
superimposed by multiple layers to form a relief 
effect, making it full of unique expressiveness. All in 
all, Hakka paper sculpture is inspired by the 
traditional Chinese paper-cut art, and its novelty lies 
in the addition of superposition techniques. 
The difference between paper sculpture and paper-
cutting is that the art of paper-cutting uses scissors to 
carefully cut the folded paper according to the 
predetermined shape and pattern. After cutting, most 
of the paper-cutting art is to present a symmetrical 
pattern. The figures of paper sculpture are often like 
paintings. The overall art form does not pursue the 
beauty of symmetry. It needs to be manually carved 
and superimposed layer by layer. It requires a lot of 
time and energy of the craftsman to complete. 

2.2. Three-Dimensional Art 

Hakka paper sculpture is a hollow art that has been 
passed down through the ages, but its innovation lies 
in the three-dimensional light and shadow effect 
formed by layering the hollow art. Although the 
selection of paper sculpture materials is simple, paper 
sculpture artists have innovated the traditional Hakka 
paper-cut single-layer hollow art to create layered 
Hakka paper sculpture paintings. Using the hollowing 
art of traditional Hakka paper-cut and the new 
technique of layering, they can express the creative 
content richly. 
The production steps of Hakka paper sculpture are to 
design the artwork on the selected paper first, and 
then engrave on the paper. According to the front and 
back relationship between the main object and the 
background of the picture, the sculptor sorts out the 
front and back relationship of the engraved paper, and 
carefully carves one by one, so each of the presented 
effects has its own differences, and the whole presents 
different changes. The last step is to glue the engraved 
paper together layer by layer according to the front 
and back relationship to form a whole. The entire 
paper sculpture works in a concave and convex three-
dimensional state according to the situation, which is 
also the highlight of Hakka paper sculpture different 
from other paper sculpture arts [2]. 

3. FEATURES OF CONCEPT BOOKS 

Concept book is an innovative book design form that 
is rooted in traditional books but has a strong 
breakthrough nature and pursues multiple ways to 
realize book content. The overall design framework of 
concept books includes rational editing content and 
physical modeling structure. Rational editing content 
is the traditional content expression and book 

characteristics in books, that is, the functional 
characteristics of concept books; the physical 
modeling structure is an innovation in the form of 
communication of books, and the pictures are mainly 
reflected in materials and content display, which are 
the artistic characteristics of concept books. In short, a 
concept book is actually a book design that is rooted 
in the content expression function of traditional books 
and innovates its expression, giving readers an 
interactive, novel, and breakthrough reading 
experience. Due to the innovation and uniqueness of 
concept books, it is difficult to mass-produce them 
and circulate them in the market. 

3.1. Artistic Features 

The biggest difference between concept books and 
traditional books lies in their artistic characteristics, 
and the entire book design process is an exploratory 
design. The art form of concept books is mainly based 
on the form of expression and material craftsmanship 
to make breakthrough designs and unprecedented 
attempts in traditional books. The main purpose of 
concept books is to innovate readers' reading 
methods and change readers' traditional aesthetics of 
book art, and seek the design direction of future books 
on this basis. The significance of combining the design 
form of the concept book with the traditional Hakka 
paper sculpture art is that it can beneficially expand 
the mode of information transmission for readers, and 
can also provide readers with comprehensive and 
diversified knowledge, showing the Hakka intangible 
cultural heritage paper sculpture skills not only in the 
form of words, but also in the form of words. The 
eclectic artistic expression of concept books allows 
the public to get in touch with paper sculptures and 
understand the inherent craftsmanship and culture of 
paper sculptures, becoming the latest carrier for the 
dissemination and inheritance of intangible cultural 
heritage [3]. 

3.2. Functional Features 

The artistry of concept books is also an innovation 
and breakthrough in the original function of the book 
to spread knowledge. Its design method also needs to 
follow the reading habits and basic scientific 
typesetting embodied in traditional books, in order to 
ensure the most basic communication function of the 
book. The concept books are a bold prediction and 
imagination made by the designer for the future book 
development trend. The reason for the combination of 
intangible cultural heritage and concept books this 
time is that concept books can not only innovate a 
large number of artistic designs but also continue to 
maintain the unique functional characteristics of 
traditional books. The multi-dimensional knowledge 
dissemination of Ganzhou's intangible cultural 
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"absorbing and resurrecting love; love that stands the 
test of time and even unites different generations. 
Most frequently, this love bears a tragic connotation 
(e.g. harsh times or life circumstances separate the 
beloved) but, like in I. Bunin’s stories, which L. 
Rzhevsky greatly appreciated, love is ingrained in the 
narrator’s memory (all the writer’s works are first 
person), inevitably preventing personality destruction 
or even bringing back to life not only the narrator, but 
also secondary characters, including those recently 
being cynics and voluptuaries" [1]. 

Criticism of the Russian emigrant literature observed 
the tradition of Bunin in the work of L.D. Rzhevsky 
both at the level of form and at the content-literary 
level. R.B. Gul believed that it was exactly L.D. 
Rzhevsky to be destined to revive the true sensuality 
and beauty of eroticism in Russian literature: "The 
theme of sensual love proves a failure in Russian 
prose. It is not a Russian theme. Having turned 70, 
Bunin tried to fill this gap in Russian prose and 
created the erotic “Dark Avenues”. However, his 
attempt was not entirely successful." L. Rzhevsky, in 
his turn, considered I. Bunin one of the genius Russian 
writers and believed “Dark Avenues” to be an example 
of "Russian literary eroticism" [2]. 

Let us turn to L. Rzhevsky’s novel “The Sunflower in 
Revolt” which contains 17 chapters. It is about the 
Russian intelligentsia, emigration and the literature of 
a "home" in exile. The title originates from a poem by 
I. Drach, The Ballad of a Sunflower. The palimpsest 
technique, so characteristic of L. Rzhevsky, expands to 
the size of a large-scale philosophical allusion: 
"sunflower" is what one character, a debater and non-
conformist Sergei Sergeevich, calls the other, the 
writer Dima, "for his narcissism". 

The author skilfully projects individual destinies on a 
universal scale, while the mosaic composition of the 
novel only contributes to the expansion of its socio-
philosophical area. The thematic paradigm of the 
novel is presented by traditional for L. Rzhevsky 
themes: homeland, life and death, love, creativity, 
memory, historical mission, suffering and redemption. 

Space is one of the key elements that form the 
character’s vision of the environment and one of the 
ways to create the author’s model of the world. 
Another element that plays an important role is the 
category of time, which is closely connected with 
spatial layers. This synthesis is commonly referred to 
as "chronotope". 

Chronotope, as defined by M.M. Bakhtin, is the 
intrinsic connectedness of temporal and spatial 
relationships that are artistically expressed in 
literature. "In the literary artistic chronotope, spatial 
and temporal indicators are fused into one carefully 
thought-out, concrete whole. Time, as it were, 

thickens and becomes artistically visible; likewise, 
space becomes charged and responsive to the 
movements of time, plot and history. This intersection 
of axes and fusion of indicators characterizes the 
artistic chronotope" [3]. 

Time is inseparable from space. However, unlike 
space that acquires meaning in being filled with 
sacred objects, time predetermines the possibility of 
the formation and structural organization of space. 

In general, time is one of the main forms of the 
existence of the world, the emergence, formation, 
development, and destruction of any phenomena of 
being. The categories of time are associated with the 
sequence of stages in nature, human life and the 
development of consciousness. 

Spatio-temporal representations served as a means of 
image generalization of life phenomena, while 
retaining their objective foundation (we mean the 
"stopping: of time, its "stretching" and "compression", 
the overlap of temporal layers). However, we may 
refer to the connection of spatio-temporal elements in 
the structure of a literary work as a single whole. The 
reproduction of spatio-temporal relations by the 
realist writers of the turn of the century suggests a 
certain typology, even despite their noticeable 
creative individuality. There were no extremes or 
subjective-mystical interpretation of time and space, 
but an emotional-aesthetic variety of solutions to 
these relations was present. Flexibility in the 
perception of space enhanced the dynamism of action 
(this also marked Chekhov’s later works). The spatial 
concepts of "distance", "space", "road", while 
preserving all their reality, are also considered as 
symbols (Bunin’s prose). Bunin’s concepts of time and 
space, as we have already mentioned, are historic, 
material, and visible, but it is the author who connects 
times, epochs, civilizations, peoples, and generations, 
looking at what happened or is happening from the 
distance of centuries and spaces. 

3. MEMORY IS THE HIGHEST MEASURE 
OF HUMANITY 

Philosophically, I. Bunin makes the post-climax part of 
Tanya and Muza equal to the pre-climax part of In 
Paris and Natalie. Plot structures of stories with 
differently located compositional climax may be 
similar. Thus, short stories Tanya and Natalie have a 
spiral plot, while Muza and In Paris – a linear one. 

These structural differences only go to emphasize that 
"all roads lead to Rome": people reach life outcomes 
in different ways, and to all of them it seems (just 
seems!) that the path lies through happiness. 
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heritage paper sculpture, Hakka folk culture, 
Songcheng culture, etc. can be integrated in the 
inclusive concept books. Concept books can not only 
express the carving art of paper sculpture, but more 
importantly, the interactive emotional communication 
generated by multi-sensory interactive reading, and 
finally organically integrate the artistry and culture of 
paper sculpture [4]. 
For example, in 2019, the masterpiece of the French 
picture book diva Rébecca Dautremer — "I'm Waiting 
for You", this book uses the world's top craftsmanship 
to create a three-dimensional perspective and a sense 
of time and space intertwined on the paper as thin as 
a hair. The use of paper sculpture skills in books has 
received a lot of praise. 

4. INHERITANCE OF GANZHOU HAKKA 
PAPER SCULPTURE 

At present, a large part of intangible cultural heritage 
is gradually disappearing and declining. The reason is 
that most people do not know about intangible 
cultural heritage or even know its existence. Today's 
large-scale production of machinery also brings 
pressure to the inheritors of handicrafts, making the 
inheritance of intangible cultural heritage handicrafts 
fall into layers of difficulties. Many folk arts and crafts 
have been lost, and the inheritance and protection of 
intangible cultural heritage handicrafts requires great 
attention from all walks of life. Ganzhou intangible 
cultural heritage Hakka paper sculpture is a 
handicraft that combines traditional inheritance and 
modern innovation. It not only contains the profound 
history of the development and evolution of Chinese 
paper sculpture in past dynasties, but also reflects the 
Hakka people's new development and innovation of 
traditional crafts. 

4.1. Culture Inheritance Difficulties 

The current inheritance difficulties of Ganzhou Hakka 
paper sculpture are like those of other handicraft 
intangible cultural heritage. People in a large part of 
Ganzhou still don't know much about the production 
process of Hakka paper sculpture and its inherent 
historical heritage culture, or even the existence of 
Hakka paper sculpture. As a result, the Hakka people 
have very little awareness of the protection and 
inheritance of Hakka paper sculpture, lack of training 
of intangible cultural heritage inheritors, incomplete 
laws and regulations on the protection mechanism of 
intangible cultural heritage, insufficient publicity and 
insufficient sources of protection funds [5]. 

At present, the inheritance and protection measures 
for Hakka paper sculpture are also too small in scope, 
and more efforts are needed to combine traditional 
culture with modern industries to improve the 
public's awareness of cultural protection. 
For the protection of the traditional paper art 
intangible cultural heritage of Hakka paper sculpture, 
it is a must to clearly know that each project carries a 
unique historical mission and cultural value. Every 
craftsman in the Hakka area deserves to be highly 
valued and protected. The inheritance and innovation 
of Hakka paper sculpture also represent the 
crystallization of the wisdom of the Hakka people. The 
artistic content expressed by Hakka paper carving 
also has the unique history, culture and living customs 
of Ganzhou Hakka, and contains the local spirit and 
customs, which is unique and irreplaceable. 

4.2. Fine Craftsmanship 

Zhang Shoujiang, the intangible cultural heritage 
inheritor of Hakka paper sculpture, introduced that 
"the production of Hakka paper sculpture in Ganzhou 
can be divided into six major processes: drawing 
draft, drawing decomposition, material selection, 
engraving, trimming, and superimposing. The first 
step of drawing draft is divided into creative draft and 
shooting material, both of which need to be clearly 
drawn on the drawing paper; The second step is 
drawing decomposition. This step is the key step to 
make the engraving picture produce a three-
dimensional effect. It needs to analyze the layering 
effect of the picture carefully. Even the small tiles in 
the building in the engraving picture can be divided 
into more than ten layers; the third part of the 
material selection is mainly to choose the engraved 
paper. Generally, Mr. Zhang Shoujiang uses textured 
coated paper or kraft paper; the fourth part of the 
engraving is the main link. It begins to be decomposed 
according to the previous drawings. The overall 
engraving steps are from top to bottom, and the 
intensity is moderate; the fifth part is trimming, which 
is to start repairing the places with burrs or 
unevenness. The craftsman first uses a shaping pen to 
scrape the back of each part of the paper, and then 
uses a scratch pen to "trace" the lines drawn in the 
previous stage, and the picture will appear three-
dimensional; The sixth part is superimposing, that is 
to glue the carved parts in sequence into a whole layer 
by layer according to the requirements of the 
decomposition instruction diagram. 
The division of Hakka paper sculpture production 
links makes the production division of Hakka paper 
sculpture clear and practitioners may be engaged in 
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test of time and even unites different generations. 
Most frequently, this love bears a tragic connotation 
(e.g. harsh times or life circumstances separate the 
beloved) but, like in I. Bunin’s stories, which L. 
Rzhevsky greatly appreciated, love is ingrained in the 
narrator’s memory (all the writer’s works are first 
person), inevitably preventing personality destruction 
or even bringing back to life not only the narrator, but 
also secondary characters, including those recently 
being cynics and voluptuaries" [1]. 

Criticism of the Russian emigrant literature observed 
the tradition of Bunin in the work of L.D. Rzhevsky 
both at the level of form and at the content-literary 
level. R.B. Gul believed that it was exactly L.D. 
Rzhevsky to be destined to revive the true sensuality 
and beauty of eroticism in Russian literature: "The 
theme of sensual love proves a failure in Russian 
prose. It is not a Russian theme. Having turned 70, 
Bunin tried to fill this gap in Russian prose and 
created the erotic “Dark Avenues”. However, his 
attempt was not entirely successful." L. Rzhevsky, in 
his turn, considered I. Bunin one of the genius Russian 
writers and believed “Dark Avenues” to be an example 
of "Russian literary eroticism" [2]. 

Let us turn to L. Rzhevsky’s novel “The Sunflower in 
Revolt” which contains 17 chapters. It is about the 
Russian intelligentsia, emigration and the literature of 
a "home" in exile. The title originates from a poem by 
I. Drach, The Ballad of a Sunflower. The palimpsest 
technique, so characteristic of L. Rzhevsky, expands to 
the size of a large-scale philosophical allusion: 
"sunflower" is what one character, a debater and non-
conformist Sergei Sergeevich, calls the other, the 
writer Dima, "for his narcissism". 

The author skilfully projects individual destinies on a 
universal scale, while the mosaic composition of the 
novel only contributes to the expansion of its socio-
philosophical area. The thematic paradigm of the 
novel is presented by traditional for L. Rzhevsky 
themes: homeland, life and death, love, creativity, 
memory, historical mission, suffering and redemption. 

Space is one of the key elements that form the 
character’s vision of the environment and one of the 
ways to create the author’s model of the world. 
Another element that plays an important role is the 
category of time, which is closely connected with 
spatial layers. This synthesis is commonly referred to 
as "chronotope". 

Chronotope, as defined by M.M. Bakhtin, is the 
intrinsic connectedness of temporal and spatial 
relationships that are artistically expressed in 
literature. "In the literary artistic chronotope, spatial 
and temporal indicators are fused into one carefully 
thought-out, concrete whole. Time, as it were, 

thickens and becomes artistically visible; likewise, 
space becomes charged and responsive to the 
movements of time, plot and history. This intersection 
of axes and fusion of indicators characterizes the 
artistic chronotope" [3]. 

Time is inseparable from space. However, unlike 
space that acquires meaning in being filled with 
sacred objects, time predetermines the possibility of 
the formation and structural organization of space. 

In general, time is one of the main forms of the 
existence of the world, the emergence, formation, 
development, and destruction of any phenomena of 
being. The categories of time are associated with the 
sequence of stages in nature, human life and the 
development of consciousness. 

Spatio-temporal representations served as a means of 
image generalization of life phenomena, while 
retaining their objective foundation (we mean the 
"stopping: of time, its "stretching" and "compression", 
the overlap of temporal layers). However, we may 
refer to the connection of spatio-temporal elements in 
the structure of a literary work as a single whole. The 
reproduction of spatio-temporal relations by the 
realist writers of the turn of the century suggests a 
certain typology, even despite their noticeable 
creative individuality. There were no extremes or 
subjective-mystical interpretation of time and space, 
but an emotional-aesthetic variety of solutions to 
these relations was present. Flexibility in the 
perception of space enhanced the dynamism of action 
(this also marked Chekhov’s later works). The spatial 
concepts of "distance", "space", "road", while 
preserving all their reality, are also considered as 
symbols (Bunin’s prose). Bunin’s concepts of time and 
space, as we have already mentioned, are historic, 
material, and visible, but it is the author who connects 
times, epochs, civilizations, peoples, and generations, 
looking at what happened or is happening from the 
distance of centuries and spaces. 

3. MEMORY IS THE HIGHEST MEASURE 
OF HUMANITY 

Philosophically, I. Bunin makes the post-climax part of 
Tanya and Muza equal to the pre-climax part of In 
Paris and Natalie. Plot structures of stories with 
differently located compositional climax may be 
similar. Thus, short stories Tanya and Natalie have a 
spiral plot, while Muza and In Paris – a linear one. 

These structural differences only go to emphasize that 
"all roads lead to Rome": people reach life outcomes 
in different ways, and to all of them it seems (just 
seems!) that the path lies through happiness. 
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one process in their entire lives. It is difficult to meet 
the current production needs, and it is difficult to pass 
on the skills to the next generation in the current 
environment. In comparison, the initial process of 
Hakka paper sculpture has low technical content. 
Many other paper sculptures can cooperate with 
machines to improve efficiency, and the competition 
is becoming more and more fierce. Its fine hand-
making skills have also become a major difficulty in its 
development [6]. 

5. HAKKA PAPER SCULPTURE DESIGN 
BASED ON CONCEPT BOOKS 

The combined design of Ganzhou Hakka paper 
sculpture and concept books not only allows readers 
to fully understand the artistic characteristics of 
Hakka paper sculpture, but also read the written 
materials in the books to gain in-depth understanding 
of the history and culture behind the intangible 
cultural heritage. The design of a concept book starts 
by following the title design in the book tradition. The 
artistic feature of Hakka paper sculpture — its 
difference with other paper sculptures is its three-
dimensional effect. Mr. Zhang Shoujiang said: Paper 
sculpture is a kind of hollow art. The hollow art like 
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Figure 1. The artistic part of "Superimposition". 

5.2. Cultural Nature 

For the inheritance of Hakka paper sculpture 
intangible cultural heritage, the most important thing 
is to attract people's attention, and the most 
important step to attract attention is to completely 
and effectively spread the inherent historical 
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sculpture. Although there is a detailed introduction to 
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"absorbing and resurrecting love; love that stands the 
test of time and even unites different generations. 
Most frequently, this love bears a tragic connotation 
(e.g. harsh times or life circumstances separate the 
beloved) but, like in I. Bunin’s stories, which L. 
Rzhevsky greatly appreciated, love is ingrained in the 
narrator’s memory (all the writer’s works are first 
person), inevitably preventing personality destruction 
or even bringing back to life not only the narrator, but 
also secondary characters, including those recently 
being cynics and voluptuaries" [1]. 

Criticism of the Russian emigrant literature observed 
the tradition of Bunin in the work of L.D. Rzhevsky 
both at the level of form and at the content-literary 
level. R.B. Gul believed that it was exactly L.D. 
Rzhevsky to be destined to revive the true sensuality 
and beauty of eroticism in Russian literature: "The 
theme of sensual love proves a failure in Russian 
prose. It is not a Russian theme. Having turned 70, 
Bunin tried to fill this gap in Russian prose and 
created the erotic “Dark Avenues”. However, his 
attempt was not entirely successful." L. Rzhevsky, in 
his turn, considered I. Bunin one of the genius Russian 
writers and believed “Dark Avenues” to be an example 
of "Russian literary eroticism" [2]. 

Let us turn to L. Rzhevsky’s novel “The Sunflower in 
Revolt” which contains 17 chapters. It is about the 
Russian intelligentsia, emigration and the literature of 
a "home" in exile. The title originates from a poem by 
I. Drach, The Ballad of a Sunflower. The palimpsest 
technique, so characteristic of L. Rzhevsky, expands to 
the size of a large-scale philosophical allusion: 
"sunflower" is what one character, a debater and non-
conformist Sergei Sergeevich, calls the other, the 
writer Dima, "for his narcissism". 

The author skilfully projects individual destinies on a 
universal scale, while the mosaic composition of the 
novel only contributes to the expansion of its socio-
philosophical area. The thematic paradigm of the 
novel is presented by traditional for L. Rzhevsky 
themes: homeland, life and death, love, creativity, 
memory, historical mission, suffering and redemption. 

Space is one of the key elements that form the 
character’s vision of the environment and one of the 
ways to create the author’s model of the world. 
Another element that plays an important role is the 
category of time, which is closely connected with 
spatial layers. This synthesis is commonly referred to 
as "chronotope". 

Chronotope, as defined by M.M. Bakhtin, is the 
intrinsic connectedness of temporal and spatial 
relationships that are artistically expressed in 
literature. "In the literary artistic chronotope, spatial 
and temporal indicators are fused into one carefully 
thought-out, concrete whole. Time, as it were, 

thickens and becomes artistically visible; likewise, 
space becomes charged and responsive to the 
movements of time, plot and history. This intersection 
of axes and fusion of indicators characterizes the 
artistic chronotope" [3]. 

Time is inseparable from space. However, unlike 
space that acquires meaning in being filled with 
sacred objects, time predetermines the possibility of 
the formation and structural organization of space. 

In general, time is one of the main forms of the 
existence of the world, the emergence, formation, 
development, and destruction of any phenomena of 
being. The categories of time are associated with the 
sequence of stages in nature, human life and the 
development of consciousness. 

Spatio-temporal representations served as a means of 
image generalization of life phenomena, while 
retaining their objective foundation (we mean the 
"stopping: of time, its "stretching" and "compression", 
the overlap of temporal layers). However, we may 
refer to the connection of spatio-temporal elements in 
the structure of a literary work as a single whole. The 
reproduction of spatio-temporal relations by the 
realist writers of the turn of the century suggests a 
certain typology, even despite their noticeable 
creative individuality. There were no extremes or 
subjective-mystical interpretation of time and space, 
but an emotional-aesthetic variety of solutions to 
these relations was present. Flexibility in the 
perception of space enhanced the dynamism of action 
(this also marked Chekhov’s later works). The spatial 
concepts of "distance", "space", "road", while 
preserving all their reality, are also considered as 
symbols (Bunin’s prose). Bunin’s concepts of time and 
space, as we have already mentioned, are historic, 
material, and visible, but it is the author who connects 
times, epochs, civilizations, peoples, and generations, 
looking at what happened or is happening from the 
distance of centuries and spaces. 

3. MEMORY IS THE HIGHEST MEASURE 
OF HUMANITY 

Philosophically, I. Bunin makes the post-climax part of 
Tanya and Muza equal to the pre-climax part of In 
Paris and Natalie. Plot structures of stories with 
differently located compositional climax may be 
similar. Thus, short stories Tanya and Natalie have a 
spiral plot, while Muza and In Paris – a linear one. 

These structural differences only go to emphasize that 
"all roads lead to Rome": people reach life outcomes 
in different ways, and to all of them it seems (just 
seems!) that the path lies through happiness. 
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"creative process". The classical vertical text layout 
reflects the classical charm of paper sculpture. The 
second part consists of six chapters: "Introduction of 
Inheritors", "Creation Source", "Work Introduction", 

"Inheritors' Quotations", "Inheritance and 
Innovation", "Inheritance and Contribution". In this 
way, the whole Hakka paper sculpture production 
culture is introduced. 

 

 
Figure 2. The culture part of "Superimposition". 

5.3. Inheritance 

The design of Hakka paper sculpture books based on 
concept books is to combine books and paper 
sculpture for a better combination. Hakka paper 
sculpture not only carries the inheritance of historical 
paper sculpture craftsmanship, but also carries a lot of 
information about Hakka culture and Ganzhou ancient 
Song city culture [9]. All these need to be discovered 
and carried forward in a form that modern people like 
and hear. The design of concept books is extremely 
inclusive, and can combine a large number of artistic 
techniques with text information (Fig. 3). Combining 
the two can give readers a better reading experience, 
and make the paper sculpture jump out of the glass 
frame, allowing readers to have a better tactile 
experience. This can make readers to experience the 
charm of Hakka paper sculpture, in order to further 
unconsciously spread and inherit the culture of Hakka 
paper sculptures, which is intangible cultural heritage 
in Ganzhou [10]. 

 

Figure 3. The flat patternmaking of "Superimposition". 

6. CONCLUSION 

Application of Ganzhou intangible cultural heritage 
Hakka paper sculpture in modern concept books can 
further combine traditional paper art culture with 
modern emerging culture. While retaining the artistry 
of Hakka paper sculptures, it can also maximize the 
characteristics of books that can be recorded and 
disseminated, and inherit the artistry and culture of 
Ganzhou Hakka paper sculpture. Protecting intangible 
cultural heritage is Chinese people's recognition of 
traditional Chinese culture, and it is also Chinese 
people's responsibility. Hakka paper sculpture carries 
the Hakka culture, regional customs and ancient 
Songcheng culture of Ganzhou, and is also a 
traditional paper art that everyone can be proud of. In 
the face of the inheritance dilemma of Ganzhou Hakka 
paper sculpture, it is necessary to conduct better 
study, propose a more suitable inheritance and 
development model, protect the country's intangible 
cultural heritage on this basis, and improve the 
cultural self-confidence of Chinese people. 
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